
10 Milton Crescent, Brixham, TQ5 0BD
Freehold Bungalow ‐ Semi Detached
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Tucked away towards the end of a peaceful cul‐de‐sac, this charming semi‐
detached bungalow offers both generous living space and a wonderful sense
of privacy. The property is located just a mile from Brixham’s picturesque
harbour and bustling town centre, with convenient access in and out of town
via Summer Lane, or towards Hillhead for routes to Kingswear and
Dartmouth.

Within a two‐mile radius are some of the area’s most stunning coastal walks
and beaches, including Sharkham Point, St Mary’s Bay, Berry Head Country
Park, and Brixham Breakwater. Local shops and everyday amenities can be
found at St Mary’s Square, just half a mile away, while a regular bus service
runs from Milton Street to the harbour and town centre, or in the opposite
direction towards Kingswear.

To the front of the property, the driveway extends to a good length and
divides in front of the bungalow, offering ample off‐road parking, in addition
to plentiful on‐street parking nearby. There is also a garage with integral
access directly into the conservatory, providing additional practicality and
storage.

Inside, the kitchen is particularly well proportioned, offering plenty of
storage thanks to a generous range of built‐in cupboards. The lounge is
another impressive space – bright, welcoming. Both rooms connect
seamlessly to a large, south‐west facing conservatory which captures the
sunshine throughout the day, making it an ideal year‐round space that helps
to warm the home even in winter.

The accommodation comprises two well‐sized bedrooms and a modern
shower room at the opposite end of the bungalow keeping bedrooms and
living separate. Together, the layout strikes a perfect balance between
comfort, functionality, and ease of living, well suited to a range of buyers.

The rear garden is a true highlight of the property, offering a private and
tranquil retreat. With no passing traffic thanks to its cul‐de‐sac position, the
garden is wonderfully quiet, framed by well‐established borders that
enhance the sense of seclusion. South‐west facing, it has been thoughtfully
landscaped for ease of maintenance, with gravelled areas, patio seating
spots perfect for alfresco dining, and plenty of space to enjoy the sun
throughout the day. Viewing is highly recommended to fully appreciate the
space and lifestyle on offer.

• Peaceful cul‐de‐sac location • One mile from harbour and town

• Close to beaches and coastal walks • Spacious lounge

• Large sunny south‐west facing conservatory • Two well‐proportioned bedrooms

• Private, low‐maintenance rear garden • Garage with integral conservatory access

Council Tax Band: C
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Current EPC Rating: C
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