
11 Briarside Road,
Brentry, BS10 6JA



Location
Situated in a quiet cul-de-sac on a popular estate within easy
reach of Southmead Hospital, Airbus, MOD, Rolls Royce the
leisure/shopping facilities of Cribbs Causeway and the M4/M5
interchange.

Summary
Accommodation comprises entrance hall, dual aspect
sitting/dining with a bay fronted sitting area and dining area with
patio doors to the rear garden. An extended kitchen-also with
access to the garden, completes the downstairs of this property.
Upstairs there is three bedrooms and a family bathroom.

Accommodation
Please see the floorplan for room measurements and the property
layout.

Entrance Hall
With staircase to the first floor and radiator, door to:

Sitting / Dining Room
Double glazed bay window to the front aspect, radiators,
understairs cupboard. opening into the dining room with patio
doors to garden and doorway to the kitchen.

Kitchen
Three double glazed windows and door out to the rear garden,
tiling surrounds, single drainer sink unit, range of base units, wall
cupboards and drawers, work surfacing over, plumbed for
washing machine and dishwasher, inset gas hob, fitted electric
oven, fitted fridge freezer, tiled floor.

First Floor

Landing
Double glazed window, loft access, cupboard housing combi
boiler and doors to:

Bedroom One
Double glazed window to the rear over looking the rear garden,
radiator.

Bedroom Two
Double glazed window to the front aspect, radiator.

Bedroom Three
Double glazed window to the front aspect, radiator.

Bathroom
Double glazed window, fitted suite comprising panelled bath with
shower over, wash basin, low level WC, fully tiled surrounds,
heated towel rail.

Outside

Front Garden
Driveway parking for 2 cars, lawn area, path to the front door.

Rear Garden
Enclosed by fences to side and rear, gated side access, patio area
and lawn areas, mature trees and shrubs.

• Wonderful Three Bedroom Home • Popular Cul De Sac Position

• Extended Kitchen • 23 ft Sitting / Dining Room

• Front and Rear Gardens • Driveway Parking for Two

A wonderful three bedroom semi detached property benefitting from driveway parking for
two vehicles, and an enclosed rear garden located within a popular cul de sac in Brentry.

Asking Price £350,000






